
To:     Robert Sem, Samsung Electronics America
bobs@sea.samsung.com

From:  Bette Taube
btaube@fcc.gov 
FCC Equipment Authorization Branch

Re: FCC ID A3L240TR

Applicant: Samsung Electronics Co Ltd
Correspondence Reference Number: 13592
731 Confirmation Number: EA97250      
Date of Original E-Mail: 4/21/2000

Subject:    Fee Payment - EA97250  

It appears that the $940.00 fee for this application has not been paid.  
Without the payment, the Commission considers an application incomplete.  
Therefore, the final action of issuing a Grant of Equipment Authorization 
cannot be accomplished until a payment has been cleared through the Bank.  
Please provide evidence of payment as soon as possible:  1)  Date payment was 
sent to Bank;  2)  If paid by check, provide check number and amount.
         
                                                                              
                                              
The items indicated above must be submitted before processing can continue on 
the above referenced application. Failure to provide the requested 
information within 60 days of the original e-mail date may result in 
application dismissal pursuant to Section 2.917(c) and forfeiture of the 
filing fee pursuant to Section 1.1108

DO NOT Reply to this email by using the Reply button.  In order for your 
response to be processed expeditiously, you must upload your response via the 
Internet at www.fcc.gov, E-Filing, OET Equipment Authorization Electronic 
Filing.  If the response is submitted through Add Attachments, a message 
which informs the processing staff that a new exhibit has been submitted must 
also be submitted via Submit Correspondence.  Also, please note that partial 
responses increase processing time and should not be submitted.

Any questions about the content of this correspondence should be directed to 
the e-mail address listed below the name of the sender.



To:     Asim Tirmizi, Underwriters Laboratories Inc.
asim.a.tirmizi@us.ul.com

From:  Bette Taube
btaube@fcc.gov 
FCC Equipment Authorization Branch

Re: FCC ID A3L240TR

Applicant: Samsung Electronics Co Ltd
Correspondence Reference Number: 13593
731 Confirmation Number: EA97250      
Date of Original E-Mail: 4/21/2000

Subject:    Fee Payment - EA97250  

It appears that the $940.00 fee for this application has not been paid.  
Without the payment, the Commission considers an application incomplete.  
Therefore, the final action of issuing a Grant of Equipment Authorization 
cannot be accomplished until a payment has been cleared through the Bank.  
Please provide evidence of payment as soon as possible:  1)  Date payment was 
sent to Bank;  2)  If paid by check, provide check number and amount.
         
                                                                              
                                              
The items indicated above must be submitted before processing can continue on 
the above referenced application. Failure to provide the requested 
information within 60 days of the original e-mail date may result in 
application dismissal pursuant to Section 2.917(c) and forfeiture of the 
filing fee pursuant to Section 1.1108

DO NOT Reply to this email by using the Reply button.  In order for your 
response to be processed expeditiously, you must upload your response via the 
Internet at www.fcc.gov, E-Filing, OET Equipment Authorization Electronic 
Filing.  If the response is submitted through Add Attachments, a message 
which informs the processing staff that a new exhibit has been submitted must 
also be submitted via Submit Correspondence.  Also, please note that partial 
responses increase processing time and should not be submitted.

Any questions about the content of this correspondence should be directed to 
the e-mail address listed below the name of the sender.


